
 

 
 
 
Date:  05-15-2012           From: Sgt. Wayne Hanson 

  (707) 444-8095 
 

Subject: Marijuana Investigation                                    Case: HC11-166                           
 
On 05-15-2012 at about 0845 hours the Humboldt County Drug Task Force served a search 
warrant at a residence located in the 800 block of Herrick Avenue, Eureka near the Pine Hill 
Elementary School.  Agents located a sophisticated indoor marijuana growing operation in the 
residence. Agents detained two subjects who they identified as Christopher Edwin Roman age 
32 and his girlfriend, Christinia Michelle Senzig age 22. Agents seized 863 growing marijuana 
plants from the residence that ranged in size from 4 inches to 3 feet in height. Agents seized 53 
pounds of dried marijuana. 
 
Agents located LSD in the residence along with what appeared to be psilocybin mushrooms. 
Agents located evidence for a butane hash lab in the residence. Agents located two composite 
knuckles , which are commonly referred to as (brass knuckles) for fighting. Agents located two 
explosive type devices in the bedroom. The Humboldt County Sheriff’s Office Bomb Disposal 
Unit responded to the residence to investigate those two devices. Agents and the two subjects 
that were detained left the residence until the Bomb Disposal Unit responded. At no time were 
the surrounding neighbors in any danger. The Sheriff’s Office Bomb Disposal Unit took custody 
of the two devices and transported them out of the area to be destroyed at a later time.  
 
Agents noticed a possible fire hazard with electrical wiring associated with the indoor marijuana 
growing operation. Agents then contacted Humboldt County Building and Planning Department, 
who then responded to the residence. After Humboldt County Building and Planning 
Department inspected the electrical wiring they determined that it was a possible fire hazard. 
Humboldt County Building and Planning Department then contacted PG&E to have the electrical 
power shut off to the residence.  
 
Roman was arrested for cultivation and possession for sales of marijuana, possession of a 
dangerous weapon, possession of LSD, possession of psilocybin mushrooms, possession of 
destruction devices and for the manufacturing of a hash lab. Roman’s bail was set at $500,000 
dollars. 
 
Senzig was arrested for cultivation and possession for sales of marijuana her bail was set at 
$25,000 dollars. 
 
This case is still under investigation by the Humboldt County Drug Task Force. 
 
 

          Mike Downey, Sheriff 

                                                                    ############ 

Humboldt County Sheriff’s Office 
826 Fourth Street, Eureka, CA  95501 
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